
 

 

 
 

Rules & Regulations 
 

 Must be a Sizzlin’, Blazin’ or Inferno Red Hot Rewards Club member. Membership is 
free.  

 Must be present to win. All prizes must be claimed by the announced winner. 

 Must be 21 years of age or older and provide one of the following current forms of 
identification:  valid driver’s license, government photo ID, military photo ID, passport, 
state issued ID & NHBP Tribal ID.  In the event the photo ID does not have the patron’s 
address the following must be provided for verification: current pay stub, or current utility 
bill.  In the event the patron’s ID does not have a picture, but has the patron’s current 
address, the patron must provide one of the following for verification: military photo ID, 
passport, government photo ID. 

 It is the responsibility of each Red Hot Rewards member participating in the promotion to 
make sure he/she is using his/her authorized card and that the card is working properly.  
If a card is not working properly, a duplicate card be obtained free of charge at any Red 
Hot Rewards booth in the casino.   

 Limit of one (1) win per drawing ticket.  

 Winning tickets will not be placed back into the drum for subsequent drawings. 

 On August 9 the names of drawn winners will be called over the FireKeepers Casino 
Hotel main casino PA system.  Announcement will not be made in the following areas: 
Nibi.  

 Between 3:00pm – 8:00pm, winners will have 10 minutes to claim their prize.  In the 
event that a winner does not claim their Red Hot Credits, another winner will be randomly 
selected, continuing until a winner is declared or until the 4th draw. If no winner claims by 
the 4th draw, the prize will be forfeited. 

 At 9:00pm, the winner will have 10 minutes to claim their prize.  In the event that the 
winner does not claim their grand prize at 9:10 pm another winner will be randomly 
selected, continuing until a winner is declared or until 10pm. If no winner shows by 
10:10pm, the grand prize will be forfeited.  

 On August 9 all drawing tickets must be in the drawing drum no later than five (5) minutes 
prior to the drawing time. The ticket must be completely filled out to be eligible to win.  
 

 No tickets will be re-printed or replaced.   
 

 No tickets will be accepted after 8:30pm on August 9. 

 Accepting or turning in a ticket or otherwise participating in the Promotion, is an 
agreement to abide by the rules of the promotion as amended from time to time.    

 Credits expire 60 days from receipt. 

 Promotion Prizes are nontransferable; only the person whose name and account number 
are printed on the Red Hot Rewards card will be eligible to play the Authorized Card and 
receive prizes.  

 Entry into promotion gives FireKeepers Casino Hotel consent to use names and likeness 
of promotion winners for promotional purposes without further compensation. 

 FireKeepers Casino Hotel licensed employees are not eligible. 



 

 

 Each winner is responsible for paying any and all taxes on any prizes won and must 
authorize the deduction of taxes if any. 

 FireKeepers Casino Hotel reserves the right to deny participants, change, modify or 
cancel the promotion without notice. 

 NHBP Tribal Council and Gaming Commission members are ineligible to participate in 
any promotions.  

  Any dispute in this promotion must be directed to the Promotions and Special Events 
Manager.  If needed the NHBP gaming commission will become involved for a resolution 
process.   


